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Originally built during the 1950s, the building 
was originally a five-storey print works. 
Since its original construction, the building 
underwent several major refurbishments, 
one of which included the construction of an 
additional two floors in 2013. Most recently, 
the building has undergone an architect 
designed modernisation, positioning it as 
premium office space located close to the 
South Bank and Waterloo Bridge.

Working with an independent lift contractor, 
R & R Lift Co Ltd, Lester Controls was asked 
if we could manufacture a lift controller 

that would easily fit into the existing MRL 
controller housing. To confirm this, Lester 
Controls assisted with a detailed dimensional 
survey, and this along with the existing and 
refurbished lift equipment specification 
allowed us to confirm that we could supply 
exactly what the R & R Lift’s wanted.

The control solution chosen was an 
ALMEGA II non-serial, 7-stop MRL, to 
manage each of the buildings’ lifts. We 
additionally supplied non-serial Lester 
Controls indicators, landing fixtures and 
fittings.
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